Food Department GoAJ&K

Bid Evaluation Report
(As per Rules 35 of Public Procurement Rules, 2017)

1 Name of Procuring Agency  Directorate of Food AJ&K

2 Method of Procurement Open Competitive Bidding (Single Stage- One Envelope)

3 Title of Procurement Transportation of Food Grain Commodities

4  Tender Inquiry -

5 PPRA Ref No (TSE) Tender Notice 5084

6 Date & Time of Bid Closing  3rd October, 2023 11:30 AM

7 Date & Time of Bid Opening 3rd October 2023 at 12:00 P.M

8 No. of Bids Received

9 Criteria for Bid Evaluation 1st Lowest Bidder Evaluated Bidder

10 Detail of Bid (S) Evaluation  As below:-

1 PASSCO Zone Pak Patan/Sahiwal to Base Godown Islamabad.

Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical | Financial E""g:::"d Bzi'zgfkﬁff;s":? ;JA;;"F‘,’;;": €
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules, 2017

1 |Sarwar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 3.9995 1st Lowest Bidder

2 |Sardar M. Hanif Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.0497

3 |Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.,6900

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sarwar Khan & Co. at S# 1.

| 2 PASSCO Zone Pak Patan/Sahiwal to Pak Kashmir F.M Dudyal
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
: . A ; Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S# Name of Bidder Techfucal ) Fmar_lc::al Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Raja M. Akbar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 5.4011 1st Lowest Bidder

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja M. Akbar Khan & Co. at S# 1.

3 PASSCO Zone Layva to Base Godown Islamabad.
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
5 . 2 - Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S# Name of Bidder Techptcal ) Fmar‘mal Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Sarwar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.2694 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Sardar M. Hanif Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.3745

Lowest evaluated Bid

der: The bid is accept in favour

of Sarwar Khan & Co. at S#1.

4 PASSCO Zone Khaniwal to Base Godown Islamabad.
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
; . . ; Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S.# Name of Bidder Techplcal ' Fmar_lt:lal Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
3 |Sarwar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.2597 1st Lowest Bidder
1 |Sardar M. Hanif Khan & Co. N/A N/A 44377
2 |Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. N/A N/A 5.0600

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sarwar Khan & Co. at S#1.




5 PASSCO Zone Khaniwal to Pak Kashmir F.M Dudyal
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
- . . . Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
o Hame. oF Biler Thne | il Cost | as perRule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable} | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. N/A N/A 6.1000 1st Lowest Bidder
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. at S# 1.
6 PASSCO Zone Vehari to Base Godown Islamabad.
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
; . . . Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
& MBI G BRer Techprcal . Fmar_lcral Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Sarwar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 43311 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |sardar M. Hanif Khan & Co. N/A N/A 44793
3 |Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. N/A N/A 5.1500
4 |Adeel Khushal Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.5900
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sarwar Khan & Co. at S#1.
7 PASSCO Zone Bhawalnagar to Base Godown Islamabad.
Barke Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
: . . : Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S.i# Name of Bidder Techfucal ] Fmar_rcnal Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Sarwar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.2879 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Sardar M. Hanif Khan & Co. N/A N/A 44797
3 |Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. N/A N/A 5.1500
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sarwar Khan & Co. at S#1.
8 PASSCO Zone Bhawalnagar to Pak Kashmir F.M Dudyal
Marks Rule / Requlation / SBD / Policy /
. . . . Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S.# Name of Bidder Techplcal ] Fmar‘lcral Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable} | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. N/A N/A 6.1000 1st Lowest Bidder.
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. at S# 1.
9 PASSCO Zone Borewala to Base Godown Islamabad.
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
. . . . Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S.# Name of Bidder Techplcal ] Finar]cral Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Sarwar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 42311 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Sardar M. Hanif Khan & Co. N/A N/A 43923
3 |Raja M. Azad Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.9900
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sarwar Khan & Co. at S#1.
10 PASSCO Zone Khanpur to Siddiqui FM Jatlan
Marks Rule 7 Regulation / SBD  Policy 7 |
. - - - Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
o4 RbiR OF B10eEr ininiimerc | (Riiaiiimebinns Cost | as perRule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Muhammad Waseem Khan N/A N/A 6.7999 1st Lowest Bidder.

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Muhammad Waseem Khan at S# 1.




11 PASSCO Zone Khanpur to Pak Kashmir FM Dudyal
Marks Rule 7 Regulation /] SBD [ POlicy 7|
- - _ - Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S.# Name of Bidder Techfucal ] Fmar_u:tal Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |No Bid N/A N/A 1st Lowest Bidder,
Lowest evaluated Bidder: No any bid is received for this station so this bid is recalled
12 PASSCO Multan Lohdran to Pak Kashmir FM Dudyal
Marks Evaluated gasis for Rejection / Acceptance
S# Name of Bidder Techflical ) Finaqcial Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules 2017
1 |No Bid N/A N/A 1st Lowest Bidder.
Lowest evaluated Bidder: No any bid is received for this station so this bid is recalled
13 B.G Islamabad to Poonch F.M Arja
Marks
Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
it applicable) | (if applicable Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
aep k| (Fagp ) Rules,2017
1 |Sarwar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 4.5849 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Ch. Nazim Rafique & Sons N/A N/A 4.7339
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sarwar Khan & Co. at S#1.
14 B.G Islamabad to Jadeed F.M Goraha
Marks
Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
2 > . : Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S# Name of Bidder IfTech;ucg: ‘mea:‘]CIT;[ Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules, 2017
1 |Sardar M. Hanif Khan & Co. N/A N/A 3.2919 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Sarwar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 3.3295
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sardar M. Hanif Khan & Co. at S# 1.
15 B.G Islamabad to Itifaq F.M Sensa
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
: . . : Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance
S.# Name of Bidder IfTecI}plc;: _fFlnaIa:lt:t?JI[ Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Bashir Ahmed Abbasi & Co. N/A N/A 2.3300 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Anwar Borthers & Co. N/A N/A 2.5499
3 |Mehmood Ahmed Khan N/A N/A 2.4999
4 M. Tarig Khan N/A N/A 2.3779
2 |Raja M. Akbar Khan & Co. N/A N/A 2.6500
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Bashir Ahmed Abbasi & Co. at S#1.
16 B.G Mirpur to Siddiqui FM Jatlan (IF.R)
i . ; . valuate dasis Tor hejection cceptance
B¢ Name-af Bldder Techaical | Finadcal Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |No Bid N/A N/A
Lowest evaluated Bidder: No any bid is received for this station so this bid is recalled
17 B.G Mirpur to Pak Kashmir FM Dudyal (IF.R)
potks Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / A t
. - - - valuate asis for Rejection / Acceptance
St Naie of. Riddes Technical | Financial Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules.2017
1 |No bid N/A N/A

Lowest evaluated Bidder: No any bid is received for this station so this bid is recalled




18 B.G Mirpur to Itefaqg FM Sensa (IF.R)
Marks RuIE_ 7 Rﬁgulﬁ_ flﬁ-ﬁ TSBDTPolicy ]
so | vemeorsiaer [T T Fmanem | ent™ | %ot ss ot i oo
(If applicable) | (if applicable) Rules 2017
1 |No bid N/A N/A
Lowest evaluated Bidder: No any bid is received for this station so this bid is recalled
19 Pak Kashmir FM Dudyal to Depot Dudyal _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
s#|  Nameotmiader [ Techwical | Fmanc | S/goli®" | B O T
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 0.6780 |1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 0.6950
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sufian Hussain at S# 1.
20 Pak Kashmir Dudyal to Depot Kathar Dilawar Khan _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Evag::lt - Basi;:fairie;stiz;-l ;A::e:;m:e s
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 1.7570 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 1.8150
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sufian Hussain at S# 1.
21 Pak Kashmir Dudyal to Depot Siakh _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
s#|  Name of Biader Technical | _Financial | aeer e | o res st A o
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 1.5620 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 1.6090
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sufian Hussain at S# 1.
22 Pak Kashmir Dudyal to Depot Narr
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
Si# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Evs&l::tt - Bas'i;?;ﬁfée;:zp ;‘,A;;e:;:rfe as
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules, 2017
1 }Sufian Hussain NA NA 1.4550 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 1.5510
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sufian Hussain at S# 1.
23 Pak Kashmir Dudyal to Depot Jarai _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Evag::tt od Basii:f;ileie;sﬁg: LA::e::,:T:E nE
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 1.4310 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 1.4490
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. at S#1.
24 Pak Kashmir Dudyal to Depot Gulpur _
Marks Rt{le [ Regl_llatiAon { SBD / Policy /
S.# Name of Bidder Technical Financial EV?:I::: ed Bas‘;:;ﬁ:e;;:: ;_,A;:eﬁ;:": eas
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 1.6950 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 1.7910

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sufian Hussain at S# 1.




25

Pak Kashmir Dudyal to Depot Kotli

Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD/ Policy /
s#|  Name of Bidder Tochnical | Fnancial | - moct . | o e ok or ant oo
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Ch. M. Sadig & Co. NA NA 3.0410
2 |sufian Hussain NA NA 3.1090
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. at S#1.
26 Pak Kashmir Dudyal to Depot Dongi _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial EV?;:: ad Bas‘::?;ﬁfée;::: L?ﬁf;;r:e iE
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules 2017
1 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 2.2980 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 2.7090
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The lowest bid rate is Higher then the seiling so the bid is recalled
27 Pak Kashmir Dudyal to Depot Chowki Mong
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Ev:&l::‘t s Bas':;:’;ﬁff;:g: ;JA:;?;:": eas
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 3.2090 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 3.3210
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sufian Hussain at S# 1.
28 Mangla F.M Mirpur to Depot Mirpur
T Marks Rule | Regulation / SBD / Policy ] |
S.# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Evz’:::ed Bas‘i:f;ﬁfie;sﬁz? e
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Raja Shoukat Hayat NA NA 0.5111 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadig & Co. NA NA 0.5730
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja Shoukat Hayat at S# 1.
29 Mangla F.M Mirpur to Depot Hameedpur
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S#|  Nameormidder | Tecwicar | Fmancm | <GUe | S U e e
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Raja Shoukat Hayat NA NA 13111 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 1.5050
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja Shoukat Hayat at S# 1.
30 Mang!a F.M Mirpur to Depot Mangla Hemlet .
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
s#|  Mameormigder [ Techmcal | Fmancar | SIgo RIS, S s
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Raja Shoukat Hayat NA NA 0.7611 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 0.8400
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja Shoukat Hayat at S# 1.
31 Mangla F.M Mirpur to Depot Jatlan
T Marks Rule | Regulation ] SBD ] Policy | |
S# | Nameorsidder | Tecwicar | Fmanc | <GIE | S RO e e
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Raja Shoukat Hayat NA NA 0.8111 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 0.8950

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja Shoukat Hayat at S# 1.




32

Mangla F.M Mirpur to Depot Kala Dab

Marks i i Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
. = = - valuate Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
S e or Bmioar Technical Financial Cost per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Raja Shoukat Hayat NA NA 14711 Tst Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadig & Co. NA NA 1.6250
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja Shoukat Hayat at S# 1.
33 Mangla F.M Mirpur to Depot Charroi
Marks i J Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
. " z m valuate Basis for Rejection ! Acceptance as
S.it Name of Bidder Techpucal Fmapc:al Cost per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules.2017
1 E{aja Shoukat Hayat NA NA 1.6911 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 1.9372
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja Shoukat Hayat at S# 1.
34 Siddiqui F.M Jatlan to Depot Serri
Marks — Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
2 - - - valuate Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
e PR O RiRr Technical Financial Cost per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 5.2310 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 5.3030
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The lowest bid rate is Higher then the seiling so the bid is recalled
35 Siddiqui F.M Jatlan to Depot Khoirata
Marks Eval g Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
2 = 2 . valuate Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
S.# Name of Bidder Techplcal Fmar_wlal Cost per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 5.0690 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 5.1080
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The lowest bid rate is Higher then the seiling so the bid is recalled
36 Siddiqui F.M Jatlan to Pak Kashmir FM Dudyal (IF Req.) _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
. - - - Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
S.i# Name of Bidder Techpucal Fmapcnal Cost per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
e Ijg applicable) ,:: applicable) - Eules -‘;{g.-;d
o bi st Lowest Bidder
Lowest evaluated Bidder: No any bid is received for this station so this bid is recalled
37 New Fine F.M Mirpur to Depot Islamgar
Marks ey Rule | Regulation ] SBD / Policy |
. - - - valuate Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
S.i# Name of Bidder Techfncal Fmar‘lmal Cost per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 ]Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. NA NA 1.5240 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Sufian Hussain NA NA 1.5555
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Ch. M. Sadiq & Co. at S#1.
38 Itefaq F.M Sensa to Depot Nalian
Marks — Rule.’ReguIation."S_BDfPolicy.’
: - - - valuated | Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
B Neme ot Blader Technical Financial Cost per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules, 2017
1 M. Younis Khan & Sons NA NA 4.6986 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Anwar Borthers & Co. NA NA 5.2999

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of M. Younis Khan & Sons at S# 1.




39 Itefaq F.M Sensa to Depot Qamroti/Panaggali
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Evzl::: g Bas'::?;ﬁze;s“:? AJA;EE:;:":E =
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 JAnwar Borthers & Co. NA NA 3.2786 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |M. Younis Khan & Sons NA NA 3.9999
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Anwar Borthers & Co. at S# 1.
40 Itefaq F.M Sensa to Depot Pothigala/Kerala Majhan _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S.# Name of Bidder Technical Financial EVZI;:: s Bas'i:f;ize;s“:? ;JA::?;:: —
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Attique Urehman NA NA 4.0991 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal NA NA 4.6700
3 |Anwar Borthers & Co. NA NA 5.3700
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Attique Urehman at S# 1.
41 Itefaq F.M Sensa to Depot Goi
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S.# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Ew&lz:lt ad Bas'i:?;ﬁze;;iz: ;_,A;:e:;:n: i
(If applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 M. Younis Khan & Sons NA NA 46486 1st Lowest Bidder.
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of M. Younis Khan & Sons at S# 1.
42 Gillani F.M Kohalla to Ghaziabad
Marks Rule | Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial EVZI;:: ed Baﬁ::f;ﬁff;:z: ;\JA::?,’;:R":E ™
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |M. Israr Khan NA NA 2.8053 1st Lowest Bidder.
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of M. Israr Khan at S# 1.
43 Gillani F.M Kohalla to Rangla
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
s#|  Mameormiader [ Tecmical | Fmanca | S'Go LIS S s
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules 2017
1 |Raja Sabir Hussain NA NA 3.4000 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Bashir Ahmed Abbasi & Co. NA NA 4.7000
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja Sabir Hussain at S# 1.
44 Gillani F.M Kohalla to Katker _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Evgl::lt - Basi::r;irie;sti:? ;JA::?;:T& e
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 |Raja Sabir Hussain NA NA 3.4200 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Bashir Ahmed Abbasi & Co. NA NA 4.7400
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja Sabir Hussain at S# 1.
45 Gillani F.M Kohalla to Neelum Flour Mills(IF Req. Alt) _
Marks Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
s# | Name of Bidder Technical | _Financial | = ot | oo o ko s o Ak e
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules,2017
1 No bid NA NA 1st Lowest Bidder.

Lowest evaluated Bidder: No any bid is received for this station so this bid is recalled




46 Suduzai F.M Azadpatan to Depot Danna # 4
B Evaluated | Basis for Rejection / Al t
. - - - valuate asis for Rejection / Acceptance
o SR TR _ Tec“f“cg' Financial Cost | as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules.2017
1 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal NA NA 5.9711 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 JAbdul Majeed Khan NA NA 6.5000
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Khursheed Ahmed Mughal at S# 1.
47 Jadeed FM Gorah to Palangi
i Evaluated Bu f I: : [ A I
: - - - valuate asis for Rejection / Acceptance
A hume: o Eiiader Tachucal Finsncal Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules 2017
1 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal NA NA 4.7347 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Anwar Borthers & Co. NA NA 5.9999
3 |Adeel Khushal Khan & Co. NA NA 5.2799
4 |Aamir Khatab & Co. NA NA 4.8415
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Khursheed Ahmed Mughal at S#1.
48 Jadeed FM Gorah to Gugdar
oLl Evaluated Bu'f !:'lt' I A ‘:'CY
. . . - valuate asis for Rejection / Acceptance
54 hame o Bldasr _ SRCRHICE. o Cost as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules, 2017
1 JAamir Khatab & Co. NA NA 4.8400 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Adeel Khushal Khan & Co. NA NA 5.2700
3 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal NA NA 5.3050
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Aamir Khatab & Co. at S#1.
49 Jadeed FM Gorah to Kahutta
el Evaluated Bu‘ fi I-‘\l"'?lct:‘ 1 A tI
- " - - valuate asis for Rejection / Acceptance
Ra N orEMamr _Technical Financial Cost | as per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules.2017
1 JAamir Khatab & Co. N/A N/A 4.9499 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Adeel Khushal Khan & Co. N/A N/A 5.9799
3 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal N/A N/A 6.8970
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Aamir Khatab & Co. at S# 1.
50 UK Flour Mills Rawat to Depot Holar
Macks Evaluated Bu‘f l:::t 1 Al tI
. - - - valuate asis for Rejection / Acceptance
5 Nl of-Bladsy _Technical Financial Cost | as perRule 35 of AJ&K PPRA
(if applicable) | (If applicable) Rules 2017
1 |Sufian Hussain N/A N/A 2.4850 1st Lowest Bidder.
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sufian Hussain at S# 1.
51 Depot Kahutta to Kerni Sero Danna
Marks Evaluated | Rule/Regulation / SBD / Policy / Basis
S.i# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost for Rejection / Acceptance as per Rule 35
(if applicable) | (If applicable) of AJ&K PPRA Rules,2017
1 |M. Saleem Ch. & Bros NA NA 6.5049 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal NA NA 8.4030
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is has been accepted from alternative way
52 Depot Keller to Hillan
Marks Evaluated | Rule/Regulation  SBD / Policy / Basis
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Coki for Rejection / Acceptance as per Rule 35
(if applicable) | (If applicable) oEAJBKEPRA Rules 2017
1 |M. Saleem Ch. & Bros NA NA 3.0511 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal NA NA 54019

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The lowest bid rate is Higher then the seiling so the bid is recalled




53

Depo Fetherpur to Kerni Sero Danna

Marks Evaluated | Rule/Regulation / SBD / Policy / Basis
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost for Rejection / Acceptance as per Rule 35
(if applicable) | (If applicable) ot AJAK PPRA Rl 2017
1 M. Saleem Ch. & Bros N/A N/A 3.5554 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal N/A N/A 5.7070
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of M. Saleem Ch. & Bros at S# 1.
54 Depo Palangi to Chirri Kot / Serian
Marks Evaluated | Rule/Regulation / SBD / Policy / Basis
S# Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost for Rejection / Acceptance as per Rule 35
(if applicable) | (If applicable) oF AR PRA Ruleg 2051
1 |Khursheed Ahmed Mughal N/A N/A 2.7311 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Ch. Nazim Rafique & Sons N/A N/A 3.5379
3 |Anwar Borthers & Co. N/A N/A 3.1786
4 |Ch. Mohsin Aziz N/A N/A 3.2929
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Khursheed Ahmed Mughal at S# 1.
55 Neelum F.M Muzaffarabad to Depot Mzd. (Dhani Seydan)
Marks Evaluated |RUle / Regulation / SBD / Policy / Basis
S.# |Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cott for Rejection / Acceptance as per Rule
(If applicable) (If applicable) 35 of AJ&K PPRA Rules, 2017
1 |Sardar Tarig Hameed NA NA 1.8394 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. NA NA 2.2100
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Sardar Tariq Hameed at S# 1.
56 Neelum F.M Muzaffarabad to Depot Chinari/Chakothi
Marks Evaluated |RUle / Regulation / SBD / Policy / Basis
S# |Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost for Rejection / Acceptance as per Rule
(If applicable) (If applicable) 35 of AJEK PPRA Rules, 2017
1 |Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. NA NA 3.4010 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Sardar Tariq Hameed NA NA 4.2500
3 |Shazain & Brothers NA NA 4.2000
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. at S# 1.
57 Neelum F.M Muzaffarabad to Depot Revend
Marks Evaluated |Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy / Basis
S.# |Name of Bidder Technical Financial Gt for Rejection / Acceptance as per Rule
(If applicable) | (If applicable) 35 of AJ&K PPRA Rules,2017
1 |M. Saeed Zafar Abbasi NA NA 6.5094 1st Lowest Bidder
2 |Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. NA NA 6.9000
3 |Sardar Tariq Hameed NA NA 7.0050
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of M. Saeed Zafar Abbasi at S# 1.
58 Neelum F.M Muzaffarabad to Depot Chikkar
Marks Evaluated |RUle / Regulation / SBD / Policy / Basis
S.# |Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost for Rejection / Acceptance as per Rule
(If applicable) | (If applicable) 35 of AJ&K PPRA Rules, 2017
1 |Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. NA NA 3.3088 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Sardar Tariq Hameed NA NA 6.2500
3 |Shazain & Brothers NA NA 4.2500

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. at S# 1.
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59 Neelum F.M Muzaffarabad to Depot Non Bagla/Mera Khurad ™~
' Marks Evaluated | _Rule/Regulation fsm\
S.# |Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost Basis for Rejection / ACCeptan:: ;s
(If applicable) | (If applicable) per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA Ruey 50
1 |Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. NA NA 5.2642 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Shazain & Brothers NA NA 6.1887
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. at S#1.
60 Neelum F.M Muzaffarabad to Depot Sharda
Marks Evaluated | Rule/Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S.# |Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
(If applicable) | (If applicable) per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA Rules,2017
1 |Shazain & Brothers NA NA 8.1786 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. NA NA 8.9598
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of Shazain & Brothers at S# 1.
61 Depot Hattian Bala to Depot Gundi Gran
Marks Eoaliated Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S.# |Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
(If applicable) | (If applicable) per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA Rules, 2017
1 |M. Saeed Zafar Abbasi NA NA 9.3754 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. NA NA 9.9990
3 |Sardar Tariq Hameed NA NA 11.5000
Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of M. Saeed Zafar Abbasi at S#1.
62 Depot Hattian Bala to Depot Ghel Jabra
) Marks Evaluated Rule / Regulation / SBD / Policy /
S.# |Name of Bidder Technical Financial Cost Basis for Rejection / Acceptance as
(If applicable) | (If applicable) per Rule 35 of AJ&K PPRA Rules,2017
1 |M. Saeed Zafar Abbasi NA NA 5.0034 1st Lowest Bidder.
2 |Raja M. Daleel Khan & Co. NA NA 6.8530
3 |Sardar Tariq Hameed NA NA 6.3500

Lowest evaluated Bidder: The bid is accept in favour of M. Saeed Zafar Abbasi at S# 1.
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